
Global TeI*Link's Response
To the State ofAlabama's
Invitation To Bid # 07-X-2170936
Inmate and Public Payphones
October 25, 2006

TERMS AND PRICE

GTI
IL

State of Alabanla Signature and Price Sheets

Commission Percentage Guarantee Calculation

Call Rate Tables



Global Tel*Link's Response
To the State of Alabama's
Invitation To Bid # 07-X-2I70936
Inmate and Public Payphones
October 25, 2006

GTI
~IL.

6

J



07-x-2170936

010000
DEPARTMENT OF FINANCE

TA497
09/06/06
63107100100
(261)479-4500
1346561
JENNIFER SIGLER
(334) 242 7370­
(334) 242-7250

REQ. AGENCY

INVITATION TO BID NO:

INVITATION TO BID

STATE OF ALABAMA
DEPARTMENT OF FINANCE
DIVISION OF PURCHASING

TELEPHONE SERVICES - PAY AND INMATE MANDATORY PRE-BID
CONFERENCE

FOR :

AGENCY REQ. ND.
----------------------1 T- NUMBER

DATE ISSUED
VENDOR NO.
VENDOR PHONE NC.

;-__-e::;='-- +SNAP REQ. NO.

BUYER NAME
BUYER PHONE NO.
PURCHASING PHONE NO:

\
1

BIDS WILL BE PUBLICLY OPENED:
DATE: 10/11/06 TIME: 10:00 AM
DATE: 10/26/06 TIME: 2: OOPM
<chanaed per Addendum 1)

AL 36607

2609 CAMERON ST

MOBILE

GLOBAL TEL*LINK
t-------------------------------IBID MUST BE RECEIVED BEFORE:

DA'l'E: 10/10/06 TIME: 5:00 PM
DATE: 10/25/06 TIME: 5:00 PM
(changed per Addendum 1)

TO BE COMPLETED BY VENDOR

INFORMATION IN THIS SECTION SHOULD BE PROVIDED,AS APPROPRIATE. BID RESPONSE MUST BE IN INK OR TYPED WITH
ORIGINAL SIGNATURE AND NOTARIZATION.

(THIS NUMBER WILL APPEAR ON THE PURCHASE ORDER.)

INTERNET WEBSITE: www.globaltellink.com
VENDOR'S QUOTATION REFERENCE NUMBER, IF ANY:

E-MAIL ADDRESS: Teresa.Ridgewaylgtl.net

1. DELIVERY: CAN BE MADE per contract agree_ent (within 180 days) AFTER RECEIPT OF ORDER.

2. TERMS: not apPlicable (DISCOUNTS ARE TAKEN WITHOUT REGARD TO DATE OF PAYMENT.)

3. PRICES VALID FOR ACCEPTANCE WITHIN 120 DAYS.

4.
S.

RETURN INVITATION TO BID:

REGULAR MAIL COURIER

STATE DF ALABAMA
DEPARTMENT OF FINANCE
DIVISION OF PURCHASING
POBOX 302620
MONTGOMERY AL 36130-2620

STATE OF ALABAMA
DIVISION OF PURCHASING
RSA UNION BUILDING
100 N. UNION ST., SUITE 192
MONTGOMERY, AL 36104

SIGNATURE AND NOTARIZATION REQUIRED

Teresa Ridgeway
TVPEIPRINT AUTHORIZED

FEIN OR SSN
63-1071001

Global*Tel Link Corporation
COMPANY NAME

SWORN TO AND

SUBSCRIBED BEFORE ME THIS

I HAVE READ THE ENTIRE BID AND AGREE TO FURNISH EACH ITEM OFFERED AT THE PRICE QUOTED. I
BEEN IN ANY AGREEMENT OR COLLUSION AMONG BIDDERS IN RESTRAINT OF FREEDOM OF COMPETITION
FIXED PRICE OR TO REFRAIN FROM BIDDING.

20th
DAY OF October, 2006 2609 Cameron Street Vice President of Administration

MAIL ADDRESS TITLE

NOTARY PUB

Mobile, AL 36607
CITY, STATE, ZIP

(800) 489-4500 ext. 2211
TOLL FREE NUMBER

TERM EXPIRATION: July 16, 2007

C
(251) 479-4500 ext 2211
PHONE INCLUDING AREA CODE

(251) 375-8041
FAX NUMBER

http:www.globaltellink.com
http:Teresa.Ridgewaylgtl.net


STANDARD TERIVlS CONDITIONS VENDOR NAME

VENDOR NUMBER:

GLOBAL TEULINK

631071001-00

INVITATION TO BID
ITB
OPEN DATE
T-NUMBER
RETURN DATE

: NO.07-x-2170936
: 10/11/06 TIME: 10:00AM
: TA497
: 10/10/06 TIME: 5:00 PM

PAGE

~2

AUTHORITY:
THE DEPARTMENT OF FINANCE CODE OF ADMINISTRATIVE PROCEDURE, CHAPTER 355-4-1 EFFECTIVE NOVEMBER 5, 2001 IS INCORPORATED BY
REFERENCE AND MADE A PART OF THIS DOCUMENT. TO RECEIVE A COpy CALL (334)242-7250, OR OUR WEBSITE
WWW.PURCHASING.ALABAMA.GOV.

INFORMATION AND ASSISTANCE TO MINORITY BUSINESSES IN THE TECHNICAL COMPLETION OF REQUIRED FORMS MAY BE OBTAINED FROM
THE OFFICE OF MINORITY BUSINESS ENTERPRISE, 1-800-447-4191.

BID (ITB) RESPONSE INSTRUCTIONS REV: 06-30-06

TO SUBMIT A RESPONSIVE BID, READ THESE INSTRUCTIONS, ALL TERMS, CONDITIONS AND SPECIFICATIONS.

BID ENVELOPES/PACKAGES/BOXES MUST BE IDENTIFIED ON FRONT, PREFERABLY LOWER LEFT CORNER AND BE VISIBLE WITH THE BID
NUMBER AND OPENING DATE. EACH INDIVIDUAL BID MUST BE SUBMITTED IN A SEPERATE ENVELOPE. MULTIPLE BID RESPONSES
SUBMITTED IN THE SAME ENVELOPE/COURIER PACKAGE, THAT ARE NOT IN SEPARATE ENVELOPES PROPERLY IDENTIFIED, WILL BE REJECTED.
THE DIVISION OF PURCHASING DOES NOT ASSUME RESPONSIBILITY FOR LATE BIDS FOR ANY REASON INCLUDING THOSE DUE TO POSTAL, OR
COURIER SERVICE. BID RESPONSES MUST BE IN THE DIVISION OF PURCHASING OFFICE PRIOR TO THE "RECEIVE DATE AND TIME"
INDICATED ON THE BID.

BID RESPONSES (PAGE 1 AND PRICE PAGES) MUST BE IN INK OR TYPED ON THIS DOCUMENT, OR EXACT FORMAT WITH SIGNATURES
BEING HANOWRITTEN ORIGINALS IN INK (PERSON SIGNING BID, NOTARY, AND NOTARY EXPIRATION), OR THE BID WILL BE REJECTED.
UNLESS INDICATED IN THE BID, RETURN ALL PRICE PAGES. IF AN ITEM IS NOT BEING BID, IDENTIFY IT AS NB (NO-BID). ALL
PAGES SHOULD BE SECURED. THE DIVISION OF PURCHASING DOES NOT ASSUME RESPONSIBILITY FOR MISSING PAGES. FAXED BID
RESPONSES WILL NOT BE ACCEPTED.

THE UNIT PRICE ALWAYS GOVERNS REGARDLESS OF THE EXTENDED AMOUNT. A UNIT PRICE CHANGE ON A LINE MUST BE INITIALED BY
THE PERSON SIGNING THE BID, DR THAT LINE WILL BE REJECTED. THIS INCLUDES A CROSS-OUT, STRIKE-OVER, INK-OVER,
WHITE-OUT, ERASURE, OR ANY OTHER METHOD CHANGING THE PRICE.

A "NO BID" MUST BE RETURNED TO REMAIN ON A CLASS/SUBCLASS. RETURN PAGE 1 MARKED "NO-BID". IDENTIFY IT ON THE
ENVELOPE AS A "ND-BID". FAILING TO RESPOND TO 3 ITB'S WITHIN THE SAME CLASS/SUBCLASS WILL AUTOMATICALLY PURGE THE
VENDOR FROM THAT CLASS/SUBCLASS. RESPONDING WITH 6 "NO-BIDS" WITHIN THE SAME CLASS/SUBCLASS WILL AUTOMATICALLY
PURGE THE VENDOR FROM THAT CLASS/SUBCLASS. A "NO-BID" RECEIVED LATE IS CONSIDERED A NO RESPONSE.

THE DIVISION OF PURCHASING IS NOT RESPONSIBLE FOR MISINTERPRETATION OF DATA FAXED FROM THIS OFFICE.

DISQUALIFIED/CANCELLED BID

BIDS THAT ARE IMPROPERLY SUBMITTED OR RECEIVED LATE WILL BE A RESPONSE FOR RECORD, BUT WILL NOT BE RETURNED OR A
NOTIFICATION MAILED.

AN IMPROPERLY SUBMITTED BID, LATE BID, OR BID THAT IS CANCELLED ON OR BEFORE THE OPENING DATE WILL BE HELD FOR 90 DAYS AND
THEN DESTROYED. THE BID MUST BE RETRIEVED DURING REGULAR WORK HOURS, MONDAY - FRIDAY, EXCEPT STATE HOLIDAYS. AFTER THE BID
IS DESTROYED, THE DIVISION OF PURCHASING ASSUMES NO RESPONSIBILITY FOR THE DOCUMENT.

THE FOLLOWING IS A PARTIAL LIST WHEREBY A BID WILL BE DISQUALIFIED:

BID NUMBER NOT ON FACE OF ENVELOPE/COURIER PACKAGE/BOX
MULTIPLE BIDS IN SAME ENVELOPE NOT PROPERLY IDENTIFIED
BID RECEIVED LATE
BID NOT SIGNED/NOT ORIGINAL SIGNATURE
BID NOT NOTARIZED/NOT ORIGINAL SIGNATURE OF NOTARY AND/OR ND NOTARY EXPIRATION
NOTARIZED OWN SIGNATURE
REQUIRED INFORMATION NOT SUBMITTED WITH BID

CERTIFICATION PURSUANT TO ACT NO. 2006-557

ALABAMA LAW (SECTION 41-4-116,CODE OF ALABAMA 1975) PROVIDES THAT EVERY BID SUBMITTED AND CONTRACT EXECUTED SHALL CONTAIN A
CERTIFICATION THAT THE VENDOR, CONTRACTOR, AND ALL OF ITS AFFILIATES THAT MAKE SALES FOR DELIVERY INTO ALABAMA OR LEASES
FOR USE IN ALABAMA ARE REGISTERED, COLLECTING, AND REMITTING ALABAMA STATE AND LOCAL SALES, USE, AND/OR LEASE TAX ON ALL
TAXABLE SALES AND LEASES INTO ALABAMA. BY SUBMITTING THIS BID, THE BIDDER IS HEARBY CERTIFYING THAT THEY ARE IN FULL
COMPLIANCE WITH ACT NO. 2006-557, THEY ARE NOT BARRED FROM BIDDING OR ENTERING INTO A CONTRACT PURSUANT TO 41-4-116, AND
ACKNOWLEDGES THAT THE AWARDING AUTHORITY MAY DECLARE THE CONTRACT VOID IF THE CERTIFICATION IS FALSE.



VENDOR NAME :

VENDOR NUMBER:
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SPECIAL TERMS Be CONDITIONS

:c:JvITATION TO BID

RECYCLING

T
ITB NO.
OPEN DATE
T-NUMBER
RETURN DATE:

GLOBAL TEL*L1NK

63,07 '001-00

07-X-2170936
10111106 TIME: 10:00AM
TA497
10/10/0611ME:5:00PM

PAGi:

3

WE ENCOURAGE AND SUPPORT THE PURCHASE OF AND USE OF ITEMS CONTAINING
RECYCLED MATERIALS, ENERGY EFFICIENT AND ENVIRONMENTLY SAFE PRODUCTS.

SALES TAX EXEMPTION

PURSUANT TO THE CODE OF ALABAMA, 1975, TITLE 40-23-4 (A) (11), THE
STATE OF ALABAMA IS EXEMPT FROM PAYING SALES TAX. AN EXEMPTION LETTER
WILL BE FURNISHED UPON REQUEST.

INVOICES

INQUIRIES CONCERNING PAYMENT AFTER INVOICES HAVE BEEN SUBMITTED ARE
TO BE DIRECTED TO THE RECEIVING AGENCY, NOT THE DIVISION OF PURCHASING

BID RESPONSES AND BID RESULTS

UNEVALUATED BID RESPONSES (NOT BID RESULTS) ARE AVAILABLE ON OUR WEB
SITE AT WWW.PURCHASING.STATE.AL.US. BID RESULTS WILL BE MADE AVAILABLE

~ FOR REVIEW IN THE DIVISION OF PURCHASING OFFICE, BUT ONLY AFTER THE BID
~ HAS BEEN AWARDED. WE DO NOT FAX OR MAIL COPIES OF BID RESULTS. IF A

VENDOR WISHES TO REVIEW BID RESULTS IN OUR OFFICE, THEY SHOULD FAX
THEIR REQUEST TO REVIEW THE BID TWO DAYS IN ADVANCE TO THE "BID REVIEW
CLERK" AT (334) 242-4419. BE SURE TO REFERENCE THE BID NUMBER.

FOREIGN CORPORATION - CERTIFICATE OF AUTHORITY

ALABAMA LAW PROVIDES THAT A FOREIGN CORPORATION (AN OUT-OF-STATE
COMPANY/FIRM) MAY NOT TRANSACT BUSINESS IN THE STATE OF ALABAMA UNTIL
IT OBTAINS A CERTIFICATE OF AUTHORITY FROM THE SECRETARY OF STATE.
SECTION 10 B-15.01, CODE OF ALABAMA 1975. TO OBTAIN FORMS FOR A
CERTIFICATE OF AUTHORITY, CONTACT THE SECRETARY OF STATE, CORPORATIONS
DIVISION, {334} 242-5324. THE CERTIFICATE OF AUTHORITY DOES NOT KEEP
THE VENDOR FROM SUBMITTING A BID.

BID IDENTIFICATION

REFERENCE PAGE 2, ITEM 2. DUE TO THE POSTAL SERVICE PUTTING BAR CODE
LABELS ON ENVELOPES, IT CONCEALS THE BID NUMBER AND DATE IF THE VENDOR
HAS WRITTEN THEM OTHER THAN THE LOWER LEFT CORNER, THEREFORE THE BID
WOULD BE REJECTED FOR NOT BEING PROPERLY IDENTIFIED.

**********************************************************************

AWARD:C AWARD WILL BE MADE "ALL OR NONE" TO THE HIGHEST RESPONSIBLE BIDDER
MEETING ALL SPECIFICATIONS.

http:WWW.PURCHASING.STATE.AL.US


: NO.07-X-2170936
: 10/11/06 TIME: 10:00AM
: TA497
: 10/10/06 TIME: 5:00 PM

SPECIAL TERMS CONDITIONS

INVITATION TO BID

VENDOR NAMI:.

VENDOR NUMBER:

ITB
OPEN DATE
T-NUMBER
RETURN DATE

GLOBAL TEL*LINK

631071001-00

PAGE":)l

3 YEAR CONTRACT WITH TWO RENEWAL YEARS:
TO ESTABLISH A THREE YEAR CONTRACT WITH FIRM PRICING AND TWO OPTIONAL
RENEWAL YEARS.

USAGE: STATE AGENCIES, POLITICAL SUBDIVISIONS, CITY AND COUNTY
AGENCIES. STATE COLLEGES AND UNIVERSITIES, MUNICIPALITIES.

ANNUAL AGREEMENT:

THE PURCHASE ORDER CONSTITUTES A CONTRACT BETWEEN THE STATE OF ALABAMA
AND THE VENDOR. THE VENDOR ACCCEPTS THE CONTRACT AS WRITTEN AND WILL
FULFILL ALL REQUIREMENTS FOR THE VALID PERIOD INDICATED.

CHANGES/MODIFICATIONS ARE ALLOWED ONLY BY A WRITTEN PURCHASE ORDER
CHANGE THROUGH THE DIVISION OF PURCHASING.

INVOICE TO BE BILLED IN ARREARS, TO THE "BILL TO" ADDRESS.

**********************************************************************
************************ NOTICE *****************************

NOTWITHSTANDING ANY OTHER PROVISION OF THIS I.T.B., DEPARTMENT OF
FINANCE ADMINISTRATIVE RULES 355 4 1 .01 THROUGH 355-4-1-.09 WHICH
GOVERN THE PURCHASE OF GOODS AND SERVICES FROM THE LOWEST
RESPONSIBLE BIDDER ARE NOT APPLICABLE TO THIS TRANSACTION.
**********************************************************************

http:355-4-1-.09
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PAGE

~ACHMENTS VENDOR NAME GLOBAL TEL*LINK,
5VENDOR NUMBER:

631071001-00

ITB NO. 07-x-2170936
10:00AMOPEN DATE 10/11/06 TIME:

T-NUMBER TA497INVITATION TO BID
RETURN DATE: 10/10/06 TIME: 5:00 PM

A MANDATORY PRE-BID CONFERENCE IS SCHEDULED AS FOLLOWS:
DATE: SEPTEMBER 21, 2006 STATE PURCHASING
TIME: 2:00 PM 100 N UNION STREET

SUITE 192, CONFERENCE ROOM I
MONTGOMERY, AL 36104

4~
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VENDOR NAME



VENDOR NAME :
GLOBAL TEL*LINK

VENDOR NUMBER:

,
,,

I
PRICE SHEET

'\INVITATION TO BID

~

ITB NO.
OPEN DATE
T-NUMBER
RETURN DATE:

631071001-00

07-x-2170936
10/11/06 TIME: 10: OOAM
TA497
10/10/06 TIME: 5:00 PM

PAGE

LINE
NO. COMMODITY/SERVICE DESCRIPTION

UNLESS SPECIFIED OTHERWISE BELOW:
SHIP TO: R1 /
STATEWIDE

RECYCLE
/ENERGY QUANTITY UNIT UNIT PRICE

EXTENDED
AMOUNT

00001 OMMODITY CODE: 915 -77 -07 5872 1 EA
ELEPHONE SERVICE - INMATE
OMMISSION PERCENTAGE TO BE PAID
(PLEASE LIST AS A PERCENTAGE WITH 61.500% $6,457,5003 DECIMAL PLACES).

00002 OMMODITY CODE: 915-77-075872 1 EA
ELEPHONE SERVICE - PUBLIC PAY TELEPHONE
OMMISSION PERCENTAGE TO BE PAID 61.500% $73,800(PLEASE LIST AS A PERCENTAGE WITH 3

DECIMAL PLACES).

PAGE TOTAL

BID TOTAL
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12.2 VENDORS COMMISSION PERCENTAGE GUARANTEE

This form must be completed by the vendor, or the bid will be rejected. NO WARRANTY,
EXPRESSED OR IMPLIED, is made by the STATE that any contract resulting from this ITB
will include an equal or greater number ofpay telephones, revenue, or minutes of usage, as
identified in ATTACHMENT C, ATTACHMENT E or elsewhere in this ITB.

The vendor is to enter on Line 1, Column A, the percentage factor they will guarantee to pay for
all inmate revenues. The percentage factor will be entered with three decimal places. For
example, ifthe guaranteed percentage amount is 50%, 50.000 would be entered on Line 1,
Column A. The vendor is to then multiply the (STATE) estimated inmate revenue (Line 1,
Column B) by the percentage (Line 1, Column A) and enter the total in Line 1, Column C.

The vendor is to enter on Line 2, Column A, the percentage factor they will guarantee to pay for
all public (non-inmate) revenues. The percentage factor will be entered with three decimal
places. For example, if the guaranteed percentage amount is 50%, 50.000 would be entered on
Line 2, Column A. The vendor is to then multiply the (STATE) estimated public revenue (Line
2, Column B) by the percentage (Line 2, Column A) and enter the total in Line 2, Column C.

These two percentage factors will be applied to the vendorcr gross inmate and public revenues to
determine the commissions owed to the STATE each month.

The total of Line 1, Column C and Line 2, Column C will be the basis for award, assuming all
technical specifications have been met.

ColumnA
Percentage Guarantee

Column B
Estimated Revenue

Column C
Total $$

LINE 1 61.500% x $10,500,000 = $ 6,457,500

73,800= $
--==~--

x $120,00061.500%LINE 2

The Line 1 commission percentage factor (Column A) entered above must be transferred to the
price sheet (Page-+ Page 6) and entered under unit price for Line 1.

The Line 1 total dollar amount (Column C) entered above must be transferred to the price sheet
(Page-+ Page 6) and entered under extended amount for Line 1.

The Line 2 commission percentage factor (Column A) entered above must be transferred to the
price sheet (Page-+ Page 6) and entered under unit price for Line 2.

The Line 2 total dollar amount (Column C) entered above must be transferred to the price sheet
(Page-+ Page 6) and entered under extended amount for Line 2.

Extended amount for lines 1 and 2 on page-+ page 6 must then be totaled and the total
amount entered at the right hand bottom of the page.

(Changes per Addendum 1: InmatelPayphone ITB Specification Modifications.)

7
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Global Tel*Link's Response
To the State ofAlabama's
Invitation To Bid# 07-X-2170936
Inmate and Public Payphones
October 25, 2006

Global Tel*Link Corporation

Inmate Calling Rates

Alabama Department of Corrections

Local: $2.85 Flat

IntraLata: $2.25 surcharge plus the below listed per minute rates

GTI
IL

DAY EVENING NIGHTIWEEKEND
Addt'l Int'l Addt'l Int'l Addt'l

Miles: Int'l Min. Min. Min. Min. Min. Min.

0-12 $0.1100 $0.0900 $0.0825 $0.0675 $0.0550 $0.0450
11-16 $0.1700 $0.1500 $0.1275 $0.1125 $0.0850 $0.0750
17-22 $0.1700 $0.1700 $0.1275 $0.1275 $0.0850 $0.0850
23-30 $0.1700 $0.1700 $0.1275 $0.1275 $0.0850 $0.0850
31-40 $0.1700 $0.1700 $0.1275 $0.1275 $0.0850 $0.0850

1 41-55 $0.1700 $0.1700 $0.1275 $0.1275 $0.0850 $0.0850

1 C
56-70 $0.1760 $0.1760 $0.1320 $0.1320 $0.0880 $0.0880
71-85 $0.1800 $0.1800 $0.1350 $0.1350 $0.0900 $0.0900
86+ $0.1800 $0.1800 $0.1350 $0.1350 $0.0900 $0.0900

Interlata: $2.25 surcharge plus $0.30 per minute

Interstate: $4.99 surcharge plus $0.89 per minute
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Global Tel*Link's Response

GTITo the State of Alabama's
Invitation To Bid # 07-X-2 [70936 IL.
Inmate and Public Payphones
October 25, 2006

CJ
Global Tel*Link Corporation

Public Payphone Calling Rates

State of Alabama

Cash Calls

1+
Local Cash Call $0.50 for an unlimited call call
IntraLATA Cash $1.00 first 4 min, $0.25 ea add
Call min 1+ Long Distance
InterLATA Cash $1.00 first 4 min, $0.25 ea add
Call min 1+ Long Distance
Interstate Cash $1.00 first 4 min, $0.25 ea add
Call min 1+ Long Distance

Operator
Assisted

Calls
Interstate Interlata AUTO_OP_3RD 6.99 0+
Interstate Interlata AUTO_OP_3RD_ZM 6.99
Interstate Interlata AUTO_OP_BANK 5.99

CJ
Interstate Interlata AUTO_OP_BANK_ZM 5.99

l
Interstate Interlata AUTO_OP_BOC 5.99
Interstate Interlata AUTO_OP_BOC_ZM 5.99
Interstate Interlata AUTO_OP_COLLECT 5.99
Interstate Interlata AUTO_OP_COLLECT_ZM 7.50

Interstate Interlata BONG_BANK 5.99 Credit Card
Interstate Interlata BONG_BOC 5.99 Credit Card

Interstate Interlata L1VE_OP_3RD_PARTY 6.99 0+
Interstate Interlata L1VE_OP_3RD_ZM 9.99 0+
Interstate Interlata L1VE_OP_BANK 7.50
Interstate Interlata L1VE_OP_BANK_ZM 7.50
Interstate Interlata L1VE_OP_BOC 7.50
Interstate Interlata L1VE_OP_BOC_ZM 7.50
Interstate Interlata L1VE_OP_COLLECT 7.50
Interstate Interlata L1VE_OP_COLLECT_ZM 7.50

Interstate Interlata P2P_3RD_PARTY 12.50
Interstate Interlata P2P_BANK 12.50
Interstate Interlata P2P_BOC 12.50

I Interstate Interlata P2P_COLLECT 12.50
Interstate Interlata P2P_L1VE_OP_3RD_ZM 12.50

C
Interstate Interlata P2P_L1VE_OP_BANK_ZM 12.50

.~ Interstate Interlata P2P_L1VE_OP_BOC_ZM 12.50
i
~
j,
5
~

i
I



Global Tel*Link's Response

GTITo the State ofAlabama's
Invitation To Bid # 07-X-2170936 ~IL.
Inmate and Public Payphones
October 25, 2006

Interstate Interlata P2P_L1VE_OP_COLLECT_ZM 12.50 J
Interstate Intralata AUTO_OP_3RD 6.99
Interstate Intralata AUTO_OP_3RD_ZM 6.99
Interstate Intralata AUTO_OP_BANK 5.99
Interstate Intralata AUTO_OP_BANK_ZM 5.99
Interstate Intralata AUTO_OP_BOC 5.99
Interstate Intralata AUTO_OP_BOC_ZM 5.99
Interstate Intralata AUTO_OP_COLLECT 5.99
Interstate Intralata AUTO_OP_COLLECT_ZM 7.50

Interstate Intralata BONG_BANK 5.99
Interstate Intralata BONG_BOC 5.99

Interstate Intralata L1VE_OP_3RD_PARTY 6.99
Interstate Intralata L1VE_OP_3RD_ZM 9.99
Interstate Intralata L1VE_OP_BANK 7.50
Interstate Intralata L1VE_OP_BANK_ZM 7.50
Interstate Intralata L1VE_OP_BOC 7.50
Interstate Intralata L1VE_OP_BOC_ZM 7.50
Interstate Intralata L1VE_OP_COLLECT 7.50
Interstate Intralata L1VE_OP_COLLECT_ZM 7.50 J
Interstate Intralata P2P_3RD_PARTY 12.50
Interstate Intralata P2P_BANK 12.50
Interstate Intralata P2P_BOC 12.50
Interstate Intralata P2P_COLLECT 12.50
Interstate Intralata P2P_L1VE_OP_3RD_ZM 12.50
Interstate Intralata P2P_L1VE_OP_BANK_ZM 12.50
Interstate Intralata P2P_L1VE_OP_BOC_ZM 12.50
Interstate Intralata P2P_L1VE_OP_COLLECT_ZM 12.50

Intrastate Interlata AUTO_OP_3RD 2.35
Intrastate Interlata AUTO_OP_3RD_ZM 3.15
Intrastate Interlata AUTO_OP_BANK 2.25
Intrastate Interlata AUTO_OP_BANK_ZM 3.05
Intrastate Interlata AUTO_OP_BOC 0.80
Intrastate Interlata AUTO_OP_BOC_ZM 3.05
Intrastate Interlata AUTO_OP_COLLECT 2.25
Intrastate Interlata AUTO_OP_COLLECT_ZM 3.05

Intrastate Interlata BONG_BANK 0.80
Intrastate Interlata BONG_BOC 0.80

Intrastate Interlata L1VE_OP_3RD_PARTY 2.35
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To the State ofAlabama's
Invitation To Bid # 07-X-2 I70936
Inmate and Public Payphones
October 25, 2006

Intrastate Interlata
Intrastate Interlata
Intrastate Interlata
Intrastate Interlata
Intrastate Interlata
Intrastate Interlata
Intrastate Interlata

Intrastate Interlata
Intrastate Interlata
Intrastate Interlata
Intrastate Interlata
Intrastate Interlata
Intrastate Interlata
Intrastate Interlata
Intrastate Interlata

L1VE_OP_3RD_ZM
L1VE_OP_BANK
L1VE_OP_BANK_ZM
L1VE_OP_BOC
L1VE_OP_BOC_ZM
L1VE_OP_COLLECT
L1VE_OP_COLLECT_ZM

P2P_3RD_PARTY
P2P_BANK
P2P_BOC
P2P_COLLECT
P2P_L1VE_OP_3RD_ZM
P2P_L1VE_OP_BANK_ZM
P2P_L1VE_OP_BOC_ZM
P2P_L1VE_OP_COLLECT_ZM

3.15
2.25
3.05
2.25
3.05
2.25
3.05

4.90
4.90
4.90
4.90
5.70
5'.70
5.70
5.70

GTI
IL.

Intrastate Intralata AUTO_OP_3RD 2.35
Intrastate Intralata AUTO_OP_3RD_ZM 2.35
Intrastate Intralata AUTO_OP_BANK 2.25

C Intrastate Intralata AUTO_OP_BANK_ZM 2.25
Intrastate Intralata AUTO_OP_BOC 0.80
Intrastate Intralata AUTO_OP_BOC_ZM 2.25
Intrastate Intralata AUTO_OP_COLLECT 2.25
Intrastate Intralata AUTO_OP_COLLECT_ZM 2.25

Intrastate Intralata BONG_BANK 0.80
Intrastate Intralata BONG_BOC 0.80

Intrastate Intralata L1VE_OP_3RD_PARTY 2.35
Intrastate Intralata L1VE_OP_3RD_ZM 2.35
Intrastate Intralata L1VE_OP_BANK 2.25
Intrastate Intralata L1VE_OP_BANK_ZM 2.25
Intrastate Intralata L1VE_OP_BOC 2.25
Intrastate Intralata L1VE_OP_BOC_ZM 2.25
Intrastate Intralata L1VE_OP_COLLECT 2.25
Intrastate Intralata L1VE_OP_COLLECT_ZM 2.25

Intrastate Intralata P2P_3RD_PARTY 4.90
Intrastate Intralata P2P_BANK 4.90
Intrastate Intralata P2P_BOC 4.90
Intrastate Intralata P2P_COLLECT 4.90
Intrastate Intralata P2P_L1VE_OP_3RD_ZM 4.90

G Intrastate Intralata P2P_L1VE_OP_BANK_ZM 4.90
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Intrastate Intralata P2PJ-IVE_OP_BOC_ZM 4.90
Intrastate Intralata P2P_L1VE_OP_COLLECT_ZM 4.90

Local AUTO_OP_3RD 2.35
Local AUTO_OP_3RD_ZM 2.35
Local AUTO_OP_BANK 2.25
Local AUTO_OP_BANK_ZM 2.25
Local AUTO_OP_BOC 0.80
Local AUTO_OP_BOC_ZM 2.25
Local AUTO_OP_COLLECT 2.25
Local AUTO_OP_COLLECT_ZM 2.25

Local BONG_BANK 0.80
Local BONG_BOC 0.80

Local L1VE_OP_3RD_PARTY 2.35
Local L1VE_OP_3RD_ZM 2.35
Local L1VE_OP_BANK 2.25
Local L1VE_OP_BANK_ZM 2.25
Local L1VE_OP_BOC 2.25
Local L1VE_OP_BOC_ZM 2.25
Local L1VE_OP_COLLECT 2.25
Local L1VE_OP_COLLECT_ZM 2.25

Local P2P_3RD_PARTY 4.90
Local P2P_BANK 4.90
Local P2P_BOC 4.90
Local P2P_COLLECT 4.90
Local P2P_L1VE_OP_3RD_ZM 4.90
Local P2P_L1VE_OP_BANK_ZM 4.90
Local P2P_L1VE_OP_BOC_ZM 4.90
Local P2P_L1VE_OP_COLLECT_ZM 4.90
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1st 1st
MTS Rates min Add min Add 1st Min Add

Miles Miles Day Min Eve Eve NlWknd NIW
Interstate Interlata 0 9999 60 second timing 60 1.15 1.15 1.15 1.15 1.15 1.15
Interstate Intralata 0 9999 60 60 1.15 1.15 1.15 1.15 1.15 1.15

Intrastate Interlata 0 10 60 60 0.16 0.16 0.12 0.12 0.09 0.09
Intrastate Interlata 11 16 60 60 0.18 0.18 0.14 0.14 0.12 0.12
Intrastate Interlata 17 22 60 60 0.19 0.19 0.14 0.14 0.13 0.13
Intrastate Interlata 23 30 60 60 0.20 0.20 0.15 0.15 0.13 0.13
Intrastate Interlata 31 40 60 60 0.21 0.21 0.16 0.16 0.13 0.13
Intrastate Interlata 41 55 60 60 0.22 0.22 0.16 0.16 0.13 0.13
Intrastate Interlata 56 124 60 60 0.24 0.24 0.16 0.16 0.13 0.13
Intrastate Interlata 125 9999 60 60 0.25 0.25 0.16 0.16 0.14 0.14
Intrastate Intralata 0 10 60 60 0.14 0.14 0.11 0.11 0.09 0.09
Intrastate Intralata 11 16 60 60 0.16 0.16 0.13 0.13 0.11 0.11
Intrastate Intralata 17 40 60 60 0.19 0.19 0.13 0.13 0.11 0.11
Intrastate lntralata 41 55 60 60 0.24 0.24 0.16 0.16 0.13 0.13
Intrastate Intralata 56 9999 60 60 0.25 0.25 0.16 0.16 0.13 0.13C Local 0 10 60 60 0.14 0.14 0.11 0.11 0.09 0.09
Local 11 16 60 60 0.16 0.16 0.13 0.13 0.11 0.11
Local 17 40 60 60 0.19 0.19 0.13 0.13 0.11 0.11
Local 41 55 60 60 0.24 0.24 0.16 0.16 0.13 0.13
Local 56 9999 60 60 0.25 0.25 0.16 0.16 0.13 0.13
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